
FIRE-EMS LOG 
 

Friday, April 17 
 
7:53 am: Fire Chief Michael Cassidy responded to a Washington Street commercial building to 
investigate a fire alarm sounding. No hazards were found; the alarm was caused accidentally by workers. 
 
10:35 am: Chief Michael Cassidy responded to a Forest Park Drive residence to investigate smoke 
detectors sounding. No hazards were found; the alarm was caused by a dirty smoke detector in a second 
floor bedroom. 
 
12:50 pm: The ambulance responded to a medical assist on the sidewalk outside of a Washington Street 
commercial building. The person denied injury, and a signed patient refusal was obtained. 
 
4:45 pm: The ambulance transported an Underwood Street resident to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham Campus. 
 
 
Saturday, April 18 
 
9:00 am: Weekend Duty Officers Captain Ken Fisher and Lieutenant Mark Heavner responded to a 
Concord Street residence to investigate an illegal burn. The resident was reminded of the correct start 
time for outdoor burning, as listed on the permit he had obtained from the Department. 
 
1:17 pm: The ambulance responded to a motor vehicle crash at Prentice and Highland Streets. One 
patient was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
 
Sunday, April 19 
 
2:16 pm: The ambulance transported a Washington Street resident to Milford Regional Medical Center. 
 
6:29 pm: The ambulance responded to Stoddard Park at the softball field for a sports related injury. One 
patient was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
11:31 pm: The ambulance, along with paramedics from Events EMS, transported a Jarrbrook Road 
resident to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
 
Monday, April 20 
 
7:30 am: Deputy Chief/EMS Supervisor Jim Moore, A3 and Engine 1 went to Hopkinton to provide 
Marathon coverage.   
 
8:00 am: Forest Fire 1 went to Ashland to provide Marathon coverage. 
 
11:20 am: Fire Chief Michael Cassidy responded to Highland Street to investigate an illegal burn.  The 
fire was over the town line on Winthrop Street in Medway; the Medway Fire Department was notified to 
check for compliance with the Open Burning Regulations. 
 
11:44 am: Fire Chief Michael Cassidy responded to a Rolling Meadow Drive residence for a carbon 
monoxide detector activation. No hazards were found; it was recommended that the detector be relocated 
from the garage into the living area of the house. 
 



12:30 pm: The ambulance responded for an evaluation on Franklin Street. The resident refused treatment 
and a signed patient refusal was obtained. 
 
 
Wednesday, April 22 
 
12:46 am: The ambulance transported a Hanlon Road resident to Milford Regional Medical Center. 
 
8:45 am: The ambulance transported a Jennings Road resident to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham Campus. 
 
10:53 am: Deputy Chief Jim Moore, Engine 2 and Engine 3 responded to a smoke detector activation at a 
Willow Gate Rise residence. There were no hazards; the alarm was activated accidentally by a real estate 
agent. 
 
12:50 pm: The ambulance, along with paramedics from Events EMS, responded to a medical assist at a 
Washington Street medical office. One patient was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham Campus. 
 
4:01 pm: The ambulance transported an Oak St resident to Milford Regional Medical Center. 
 
8:28 pm: Deputy Chief Jim Moore responded to a Washington Street religious facility to investigate an 
alarm sounding. No hazards were found.  
 
 
Thursday, April 23 
 
10:35 am: The ambulance, along with paramedics from Events EMS, transported a Jennings Road 
resident to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
10:55 am: An Events EMS ambulance responded to a medical assist on Prentice Street. One patient was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
5:08 pm: Deputy Chief Jim Moore responded to a Linden Street building to investigate a fire alarm 
sounding. No hazards were found. 
 
5:11 pm: Deputy Chief Jim Moore and Engine 4 responded to the intersection of Washington and 
Highland Streets for a downed electrical wire. NStar Electric was notified to make repairs. 
 
5:39 pm: The ambulance, along with paramedics from Events EMS, transported a Fiske Street resident to 
MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham Campus. 
 
 


