
FIRE / EMS LOGS 
 

Friday, June 12 
 
8:48 AM: Fire Chief Michael Cassidy investigated a fire alarm activation at a Winthrop 
Street home.  The alarm was caused by a low battery. 
 
9:03 AM: Fire Chief Michael Cassidy, Deputy Chief Jim Moore, the ambulance and 
paramedics from Events EMS responded to a motor vehicle crash on Washington.  
Engine 3 and Rescue 1 were also dispatched for the Jaws-of-Life, but were cancelled 
prior to their arrival.  One patient was transported to Milford-Whitinsville Regional 
Hospital. 
 
12:31 PM: Forest Fire 1 responded to a motor vehicle crash at the intersection of 
Norfolk and Central Streets. 
 
1:14 PM: Fire Chief Michael Cassidy investigated a report of an explosion on Adams 
Street.  The noise was believed to be caused by someone working on a motor vehicle in 
their yard. 
 
 
Saturday, June 13 
 
2:40 PM: Weekend Duty Officers Captain Ken Fisher and Lieutenant Mark Heavner 
responded to Hemlock Drive to investigate a report of illegal burning.  The resident was 
advised of the Open Burning Regulations, and extinguished the outdoor fire. 
 
8:35 PM: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a medical on 
Winter Street.  One resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham. 
 
 
Sunday, June 14 
 
12:52 AM: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a medical 
on Elm Street.  A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 
 
8:06 AM: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EM responded to a medical on 
Jennings Road.  One resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham. 
 
 
Monday, June 15 
 
7:59 AM: Forest Fire 1 responded to a motor vehicle crash on Washington Street.   
 



8:21 AM: The ambulance responded to a medical on Oakhurst Lane.  One resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 
 
9:59 AM: The ambulance responded to a medical on Washington Street.  One resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 
 
 
Tuesday, June 16 
 
11:31 AM: Deputy Chief Jim Moore, the ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS 
responded to a medical at a Washington Street child care facility.  One patient was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 
 
12:28 AM: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a medical 
on Skyview Terrace.  A Gilford, NH resident was transported to MetroWest Medical 
Center, Framingham. 
 
1:05 PM: Chief Michael Cassidy, the back-up ambulance and paramedics from Events 
EMS responded to a medical on Summer Street.  A resident was transported to Milford-
Regional Medical Center. 
 
2:19 PM: The ambulance responded to a Norfolk Street for a medical.  One resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 
 
4:26 PM: The ambulance responded to Skyview Terrrace for a medical.  One patient 
was transported to Milford-Whitinsville Regional Hospital. 
 
4:53 PM: The ambulance responded to Summer Street for a medical alarm.  There was 
no transport; the alarm was activated accidentally. 
 
9:39 PM: Fire Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an odor of smoke on Highland Street.  
No hazard was found. 
 
 
Wednesday, June 17 
 
7:03 AM: Fire Chief Michael Cassidy and the ambulance responded to a bicycle crash 
on Washington Street.  One patient was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham. 
 
12:50 PM: Deputy Chief Jim Moore and the ambulance responded to Westfield Circle 
for a medical.  One patient was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 
 
2:33 PM: Deputy Chief Jim Moore and the ambulance responded to a motor vehicle 
crash at the intersection of Washington and School Streets.  A Bellingham resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 



 
4:09 PM: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to Franklin 
Street for a medical.  One patient was transported to Milford-Whitinsville Regional 
Hospital. 
 
 
Thursday, June 18 
 
3:55 PM: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a motor 
vehicle crash at the intersection of Washington and Highland Streets.  One patient was 
transported to Milford-Whitinsville Regional Hospital.  One individual also signed a 
waiver and refused transport to the hospital. 
 
11:02 PM: Deputy Chief Jim Moore responded to Washington Street to assist the 
Holliston Police Department with a search. 


