
Fire/EMS Log 

 

Friday, February 17 

2:52 AM: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Winter Street.  A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 

3:13 AM: Medical – An ambulance with paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Woodland Street.  A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

5:40 AM: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Marshall Street.  A resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

2:40 PM: Water Rescue – Chief Michael Cassidy, Deputy Mark Dellicker, Engine 1 and Water Rescue 1 
responded to a water rescue on Avon Street.  A dog was transported to Holliston Animal Hospital. 

6:11 PM: Motor Vehicle Crash – The ambulance responded to a motor vehicle crash on Gorwin Drive.  A 
resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

6:46 PM: Chimney Fire – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker, Ladder 1, and Engines 1 and 4 
responded to a chimney fire on North Mill Street. 

7:31 PM: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from AMR responded to a medical emergency on 
Hollis Street.  A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

8:14 PM: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an odor on 
Washington Street. 

11:06 PM: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Avon Street.  The individual 
refused transport and a signed waiver was obtained. 

 

Saturday, February 18 

8:03 PM: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Washington Street. A South 
Carolina resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

 

Sunday, February 19 

1:59 PM: Smoke Scare – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker and Ladder 1 responded to a 
smoke scare on Overlook Drive. 

2:32 PM: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on David Street.  A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 

 

Monday, February 20 

8:44 AM: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Community EMS responded to a medical alarm 
activation on Mechanic Street.  The alarm activation was unintentional. 

10:15 AM: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an alarm activation 
on Hill Street. 



11:21 PM: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Travis Road.  A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

 

Tuesday, February 21 

6:34 AM: Motor Vehicle Crash – Chief Michael Cassidy and an ambulance from Medway Fire responded 
to a motor vehicle crash on Hollis Street.  A Hopkinton resident was transported to Milford Regional 
Medical Center. 

12:35 PM: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Washington Street. 

11:10 PM: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Governor Prence 
Way. 

 

Wednesday, February 22 

7:47 AM: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Norfolk Street. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

8:11 AM: Medical – EMT Paul Coffey and an ambulance with paramedics from Community EMS 
responded to a medical emergency on Jeffrey Avenue.  An individual was transported to Milford Regional 
Medical Center. 

10:32 PM: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from AMR responded to a medical emergency on 
Spring Street. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

 

Thursday, February 23 

11:54 PM: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Community EMS responded to a medical 
emergency on Washington Street.  A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

12:39 PM: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Johnson Drive. 

6:49 PM: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Church Street.  The individual 
refused transport and a signed refusal was obtained. 

 


