
Fire/EMS Log 

Friday, February 21 

1:45 am: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Willowgate Rise. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

10:24 am: Medical – Chief Michael Cassidy and the ambulance responded to a medical emergency on 
Woodland Street. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

11:15 am: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Woodland Street. 

10:40 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical 
emergency on Kathryn Lane. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

 

Saturday, February 22 

7:36 am: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an alarm activation on 
Washington Street. 

7:56 am: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker and Captain Alan Greendale 
investigated a faulty appliance on Robert Road. 

9:35 am: Mutual Aid – Chief Michael Cassidy responded mutual aid to a structure fire on Homer Avenue 
in Ashland. 

11:25 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Summer Street. A resident 
was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

2:38 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on High Street. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

3:23 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an odor on Summer 
Street. 

6:45 pm: Assistance Call – Captain Alan Greendale responded to a child locked in a bathroom on Bullard 
Street. The response was canceled prior to arrival. 

9:38 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Brewster EMS responded to a medical 
emergency on Orchard Lane. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

 

Sunday, February 23 

12:43 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated a hazard on Robert Road. 

 

Monday, February 24 

4:19 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Gorwin Drive. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

8:25 am: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Washington Street. 



2:10 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Marked Tree Road. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

3:10 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Washington Street. An 
Ashland resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

4:41 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Community EMS responded to a medical 
emergency on Hopping Brook Road. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

4:59 pm: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy and Forest Fire 2 responded to a spill on Whitney Street. 

 

Tuesday, February 25 

1:02 am: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Country Road. 

1:26 am: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an odor on Turner Road. 

8:40 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Union Street. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

12:00 pm: Investigation – Chief Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Indian Ridge Road South. 

12:52 pm: Assistance Call – The ambulance responded to an assistance call on Concord Street. 

4:44 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Partridge Way. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

5:46 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Birch Road. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

6:28 pm: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated to an alarm activation on Mohawk Path. The 
response was cancelled prior to arrival.   

6:53 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Railroad Street. A resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

8:23 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Church Street. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

9:33 pm: Assist other Agency – Chief Michael Cassidy assisted the Police Department on Hollis Street. 

10:14 pm: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy, Deputy Mark Dellicker, Ladder 1, and Engines 1 and 3 
responded to an alarm activation on Turner Road.  

 

Wednesday, February 26 

7:40 am: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Mohawk Path. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

8:25 am: Medical – The backup ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Country Road. An 
individual was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 



1:52 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Ashland Fire responded to a medical 
emergency on Jeffrey Avenue. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

7:47 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Summer Street. A resident 
was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

 

Thursday, February 27 

3:57 am: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Lakeshore Drive. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

6:29 pm: Investigation – Captain Alan Greendale and Ladder 1 investigated an electrical hazard on High 
Street. 

8:33 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Gorwin Drive. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 


