
Fire/EMS Log 

 

Friday, February 23 

1:03 am: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS re4sponded to a medical 
emergency on Heritage Way. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

3:25 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Shaw Farm Road. A resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

9:00 pm: Assistance Call – Chief Michael Cassidy and the ambulance responded to an assistance call on 
Hollis Street.  

 

Saturday, February 24 

9:06 am: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Captain Alan Greendale investigated an alarm activation 
on Hillside Drive. 

11:59 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Washington Street. No EMS 
was required. 

10:40 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on South Street. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

 

Sunday, February 25 

3:33 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on South Street. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

12:37 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Copper Lane. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

12:43 pm: Medical – The backup ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Lake Shore Drive. A 
resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

5:25 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Goulding Streert. A resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

8:24 pm: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy, Weekend Duty Officer Captain Alan Greendale, Ladder 
1, and Engines 1 and 3 investigated an odor of smoke on Hollis Street. 

 

Monday, February 26 

2:37 am: Assistance Call - The ambulance responded to an assistance call on Hollis Street. 

 

Tuesday, February 27 

6:03 am: Assistance Call – The ambulance responded to an assistance call on Webster Drive. 

10:10 am: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated a hazard on Carlton Drive. 



5:42 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on South Street. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 

9:47 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on High Rock Road. A resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 

 

Wednesday, February 28 

8:30 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Central Street. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

10:20 am: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical 
emergency on Kuniholm Drive. A Hopkinton resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham. 

1:55 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on South Street. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

3:23 pm: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Morton Street. 

5:32 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Washington Street. A resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

10:11 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical 
emergency on Donna Road. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

 

Thursday, March 1 

11:20 am: Medical – Chief Michael Cassidy and the ambulance responded to a medical emergency on 
Hollis Street. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

8:56 am: Medical - The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Hillside Drive. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center.  

 


