
Fire/EMS Log 

 

Friday, April 14 

5:19 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Delicker investigated an alarm activation on 
Juniper Road. 

 

Saturday, April 15 

4:38 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical alarm activation on Church Street. The alarm 
was unintentional. No EMS was required. 

11:20 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Norfolk Street. A Connecticut 
resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

 1:13 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Charles Street. A resident 
was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

 

Sunday, April 16 

2:45 am: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an alarm activation on 
Taylor Road. 

6:04 am: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an alarm activation on 
High Street. 

9:10 am: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an alarm activation on 
Washington Street. 

9:41 am: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker, Deputy Jim Moore and Capain 
Alan Greendale investigated an alarm activation on Water Street. 

 2:42 pm: Mutual Aid – Engine 1 responded mutual aid to Millis for station coverage, while Millis and other 
departments battled a garage fire and brush fire on Larch Road. 

4:26 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Norfolk Street. A New York resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

10:21 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an electrical problem 
on Union Street. 

 

Monday, April 17 

1:50 am: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Washington Street. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

5:45 am: Mutual Aid – Deputy Jim Moore, Engine 1 and the ambulance provided mutual aid to Hopkinton, 
staging on Clinton Street for marathon coverage.   

7:42 am: Mutual Aid - Engine 3 provided mutual aid to Ashland, staging on Roberts Road for marathon 
coverage.  



11:35 am: Medical - The backup ambulance and paramedics from Alert Ambulance responded to a 
medical emergency on Adams Street. A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

2:20 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated a water problem on 
Goulding Street. 

8:45 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Noel Drive. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 

11:37 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Roy Avenue. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

 

Tuesday, April 18 

1:37 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Washington Street. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

7:33 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Summer Street. A resident 
was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

8:37 pm: Investigation – Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Cabot Road.  

 

Wednesday, April 19 

9:54 am: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Cedar Street. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

 

Thursday, April 20 

7:15 am: Investigation – Deputy Jim Moore investigated an alarm activation on Linden Street. 

2:04 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical alarm activation on Hollis Street. The alarm 
was accidental. No EMS was required. 

7:00 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical emergency 
on Westfield Drive. A resident was transported to Newton Wellesley Hospital. 


