
Fire/EMS Log 

Friday, June 26 

12:20 pm: Investigation – Deputy Jim Moore investigated a propane leak on Fiske Pond Road. 

12:30 pm: Investigation – Deputy Jim Moore and Forest Fire2 investigated a gasoline leak on Kuniholm 
Drive. 

3:17 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Summer Street. The individual 
refused transport; a signed waiver was obtained. 

6:19 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officers Lieutenant Richard Rossini and Firefighter Phil Robshaw 
investigated an alarm activation on Indian Ridge Road South. 

8:00 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officers Lieutenant Richard Rossini and Firefighter Phil Robshaw 
investigated an odor on Chamberlain Street. 

11:39 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Brook Street. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

11:54 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officers Lieutenant Richard Rossini and Firefighter Phil 
Robshaw investigated an alarm activation on Brooksmont Drive. 

 

Saturday, June 27 

8:02 am: Assistance Call – Weekend Duty Officer Lieutenant Richard Rossini responded to an assistance 
call on Summer Street. 

11:31 am: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Ashland Fire responded to a medical 
emergency on Regency Drive. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

12:22 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Washington Street. The 
response was cancelled prior to arrival. 

2:53 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officers Lieuteant Richard Rossini and Firefighter Phil Robshaw 
investigated an alarm activation on Pine Oak Road. 

3:49 pm: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officer Lieutenant Richard Rossini and Firefighter Phil Robshaw 
investigated wiring arcing on Granite Street. Eversource Electric was notified. 

 

Sunday, June 28 

9:09 am: Assistance Call – The ambulance responded to an assistance call on Birch Road. 

10:50 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Birch Road. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

11:13 am: Investigation – Weekend Duty Officers Lieutenant Richard Rossini and Firefighter Phil 
Robshaw investigated an alarm activation on Roy Avenue. 



12:15 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Cranberry Lane. A resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Natick. 

3:13 pm: Motor Vehicle Crash – The ambulance responded to a motor vehicle crash on Washington 
Street. There were no injuries; signed waivers were obtained. 

6:21 pm: Investigation – Deputy Mark Dellicker investigated an alarm activation on Kuniholm Drive. 

6:27 pm: Investigation – Deputy Jim Moore and Captain John Gagnon investigated an odor on Union 
Street. 

6:30 pm: Mutual Aid – Ladder 1 responded mutual aid to Medway, for smoke in the building on Summer 
Hill Road. 

8:28 pm: Mutual Aid – Engine 3 responded mutual aid to Sherborn, providing station coverage while 
crews were committed to a lightning strike on McGregor Drive. 

 

Monday, June 29 

12:25 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Central Street. A resident 
was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

8:20 pm: Assistance Call – The ambulance responded to an assistance call on Washington Street. 

 

Tuesday, June 30 

11:55 am: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Oak Street. A resident was 
transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

2:08 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Oakridge Road. A resident 
was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

8:48 pm: Investigation - Captain Alan Greendale and Firefighter Mike Quintin investigated wires arcing on 
Washington Street. Eversource Electric was notified. 

9:11 pm: Investigation – Firefighter Mike Quintin investigated alarm trouble on Hollis Street. 

 

Wednesday, July 1 

12:13 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical 
emergency on Brook Street. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

7:13 pm: Investigation - Captain Alan Greendale and Firefighter Mike Quintin investigated a water 
problem on Washington Street. 

9:24 pm: Investigation - Captain Alan Greendale and Firefighter Mike Quintin investigated an alarm 
activation on Old Cart Path. 

 

 



Thursday, July 2 

12:30 pm: Medical – The ambulance and paramedics from Fallon EMS responded to a medical 
emergency on Church Street. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

2:12 pm: Mutual Aid - Engine 2 responded mutual aid to Medway, providing station coverage while crews 
were committed to a structure fire in Franklin. 

3:16 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Pondview Road. The 
response was cancelled prior to arrival. 

4:00 pm: Medical – The ambulance responded to a medical emergency on Hollis Street. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

7:52 pm: Assistance Call – Chief Michael Cassidy assisted the police on Central Street. 

9:35 pm: Investigation – Captain Keith McKeown investigated an alarm activation on Highland Street.   


