
FIRE-EMS LOG 

Friday, October 15 

1:44 pm: The ambulance responded to assist the police on Burnap Road. The individual 
refused transport; a signed waiver was obtained. 

 

Saturday, October 16 

6:42 am: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a medical on 
Summer Street.  A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

11:06 am: The ambulance responded to a medical on Washington Street. A resident 
was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

11:12 am: The back-up ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a 
medical on Hollis Street.  A resident was transported to Milford Regional Medical Center. 

 

Sunday, October 17 

9:14 pm: Weekend Duty Officer Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an odor of natural 
gas on Greenview Drive. NStar Gas was also notified. 

 

Monday, October 18 

4:44 am: The fire department responded to a direct alarm on Summer Street.  

6:34 am: The ambulance and paramedics from Ashland Fire Department responded to 
a medical on Temi Road.  A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham. 

7:10 am: Chief Michael Cassidy and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a 
medical on Wedgewood Drive. A resident was transported to UMass/Memorial Medical 
Center in Worcester. 

8:28 am: The ambulance responded to a medical on Underwood Street.  A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

8:55 am: Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation on Rolling Meadow 
Drive. The alarm was accidental by workers. 



4:40 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy and the ambulance responded to a medical on Hollis 
Street. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

4:57 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an odor on Hollis Street. 

 

Tuesday, October 19 

11:14 am: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a medical 
on Exchange Street.  A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham. 

12:50 pm: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a medical 
on Jeffrey Avenue. A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham. 

1:04 pm: The back up ambulance responded to a medical on Washington Street. A 
resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

1:38 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy and the ambulance responded to a medical on October 
Hill Road. The individual refused transport; a signed waiver was obtained. 

5:11 pm: The ambulance responded to a medical on Woodland Street. A resident was 
transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 

5:19 pm: The back up ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a 
medical on Elm Street.  A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, 
Framingham. 

7:00 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy, Deputy Jim Moore, Ladder 1 and Engines 1 and 3 
responded to a Washington Street home for a problem with a gas stove. NStar Gas was 
also notified. 

 

Wednesday, October 20 

8:52 am: Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an odor of gas on Woodland Street. 

10:01 am: Chief Michael Cassidy, Deputy Jim Moore, Ladder 1 and Engines 2 and 3 
investigated an electrical problem in a Union Street home. 

 

Thursday, October 21 

5:15 am: The ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS responded to a medical on 
High Street.  A resident was transported to MetroWest Medical Center, Framingham. 



7:44 am: Chief Michael Cassidy, the ambulance and paramedics from Events EMS 
responded to a medical on Central Street.  A resident was transported to MetroWest 
Medical Center, Framingham. 

7:58 pm: Chief Michael Cassidy investigated an alarm activation in a Winter Street 
home.  

 


